Village of Maple Fark
302 Willow Street ¢ P.O. Box 220 ¢ Maple Park, lllinois 60151

Village Hall: 815-827-3309
Fax: 815-827-4040
Website: http://www.villageofmaplepark.com

FINANCE AND PUBLIC RELATIONS & DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE MEETING
MINUTES
Tuesday, June 26, 2018
7:00 p.m.
Maple Park Civic Center
302 Willow Street, Maple Park, IL

1. CALLTO ORDER /ESTABLISHMENT OF QUORUM
Chairman Luke Goucher called the meeting to order at 7:01 p.m.
Village Clerk Liz Peerboom called the roll call and the following Board members were
present: Trustee Luke Goucher, Trustee Bart Shaver, and Trustee Chris Higgins. Absent:

Trustee Kristine Dalton.

Others present: Trustee JP Dries, Vaughn Kirshner from Waste Management, and Village
Clerk Liz Peerboom.

2. PUBLIC COMMENTS - Any resident wishing to address the Board may do so according
to the Rules of Public Comment and should register with the Village Clerk prior to the
meeting.

None.
3. APPROVAL OF MEETING MINUTES
e May 22,2018

Trustee Higgins made a motion to approve the meeting minutes from May 22, 2018,
seconded by Trustee Shaver. Motion carried by voice vote.

4. PRESENTATION BY VAUGHN KIRSHNER, WASTE MANAGEMENT

Mr. Vaughn Kirshner from Waste Management was present to discuss the services they have
to offer.

Mr. Kirshner asked the Committee what they liked and or disliked about the program.
Trustee Goucher asked about recycling centers and the possibility of losing recycling if the
new contractor does not have their own facility. Mr. Kirshner said that this perception is true.

He also talked about price and the municipality billing for refuse services.

Mr. Kirshner advised that Waste Management is the largest recycler in the country.
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Trustee Higgins said that he has never had a problem with his garbage pickup. He asked Mr.
Kirshner about the difference between unlimited trash and a sticker program.

Mr. Kirshner talked about a modified volume program.
Trustee Brandon Harris arrived at 7:20 p.m.

Trustee Higgins asked about adding leaf pick up to the program. Mr. Kirshner said that they
do offer a leaf vac program, but that does add cost. Trustee Higgins asked about recycling
glass. Mr. Kirshner advised that there was consideration to get rid of glass recycling, but they
still recycle glass. Trustee Shaver asked about electronics recycling. Mr. Kirshner distributed
a flyer that talked about recycling of electronics, used motor oil, old cans of paint, and used
batteries. He said that the cost would be approximately $16 per resident for on-demand,
unlimited collection.

Trustee Higgins asked about education for the village and the residents. Mr. Kirshner advised
that they have social media ready material for staff to use.

Mr. Kirshner then spoke about a program called Waste Watch. This program is a training
with local police tl‘lat helpS\dnvers to catch anything out of the ordinary in the neighborhood.

Mr. Kirshner left tile meetmg at 7:41 p.m.

5. DISCUSSION Ok‘ NEW ENGINEERING FIRM

\
Trustee Goucher qirected the committee to a document that included all the references that
were contacted for both firms.

The committee discussed the pros and cons of both firms.

Trustee Higgins said that he doesn’t want Maple Park to be a Batavia, but Trustee Goucher
said that by virtue of being part of the Kaneland School District, growth is coming to Maple
Park. Trustee Dries said that he thinks that Rempe Sharpe has more experience. Trustee
Harris said that Maple Park needs to bank on growth, adding that he thinks that in the next 20
years the train will come to Maple Park.

Trustee Goucher suggested not making the decision today. Trustee Harris said that it is a
good idea to ask both firms some question before the full Board decides. Trustee Goucher
will write up some questions, send them out to the group for review and send them to both

firms.
Trustee Goucher said that it is clear to him that it is important to the group to get this right.
6. DISCUSSION OF REFUSE CONTRACT REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

Trustee Goucher pointed the committee to the two sample RFPs provided by the Village
Clerk. Village Clerk Liz Peerboom asked that the committee look over the draft RFP that was
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in the packet and let her know if they had changes. The committee discussed what dates they
would like to have the RFP opened and going with August 21, 2018 made sense then the
committee could look them over at their August 21, 2018 meeting. This made it necessary to
get the RFP document approved by the full Board at the July 3, 2018 Board meeting.

Trustee Higgins made a motion to move the RFP document, with the Committee’s changes,
to the full Board for approval, seconded by Trustee Shaver.

Motion carried by voice vote.

. DISCUSSION OF OTHER ITEMS

None.

. ADJOURNMENT

Trustee Shaver made a motion to adjourn the meeting, seconded by Trustee Higgins. Motion
carried by voice vote.

Meéﬁhg adjourned at 8:49 p.m. !
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Liz/Peerboom, C'MC
Village Clerk

Committee Members
Trustee Goucher, Chair
Trustee Dalton

Trustee Higgins
Trustee Shaver
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Vitlage of Maple Sarkk
302 Willow Street ¢ P.O. Box 220 ¢ Maple Park, lllinois 60151

Village Hall: 815-827-3309
Fax: 815-827-4040
Website: http://www.villageofmaplepark.com

FINANCE AND PUBLIC RELATIONS & DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE MEETING
MINUTES
Thursday, July 26, 2018
7:00 p.m.
Maple Park Civic Center
302 Willow Street, Maple Park, IL

THERE WAS NO QUORUM.

Liz Peerboom, CMC
Village Clerk

Committee Members
Trustee Goucher, Chair
Trustee Dalton

Trustee Higgins
Trustee Shaver
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Village of Maple Saft
302 Willow Street ¢ P.O. Box 220 ¢ Maple Park, lllinois 60151

Village Hall: 815-827-3309
Fax: 815-827-4040
Website: http:/flwww.villageofmaplepark.com

FINANCE AND PUBLIC RELATIONS & DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE MEETING
MINUTES
Tuesday, July 24, 2018
7:00 p.m.
Maple Park Civic Center
302 Willow Street, Maple Park, IL

THE FINANCE AND PUBLIC RELATIONS & DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE MEETING
SCHEDULED FOR TUESDAY, JULY 24, 2018 WAS RESCHEDULED TO THURSDAY, JULY 26, 2018.

Liz Peerboom, CMC
Village Clerk

Committee Members
Trustee Goucher, Chair
Trustee Dalton

Trustee Higgins
Trustee Shaver

Finance Minutes 7-24-18



APPENDIX A

PROPOSAL SHEET FOR VILLAGE OF MAPLE PARK
RESIDENTIAL REFUSE COLLECTION SERVICE
PLEASE TYPE

Company Name: Waste Connections

DBA if applicable: Groot, Inc

Address: 710 E. South St, Unit B

City/State/Zip Code: plano, IL 60545

Phone: 630-552-9653

Fax: 630-552-9642

President / CEO: Ronald J. Mittelstaedt

Proposal Contact (if different): Josh Molnar

Contact phone (if different): 847-734-6393

Contact Email: jmolnar@groot .com

Proposed Pick up Day: Thursday

Base Rate shall include the following:

Refuse: Unlimited refuse collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra charge,
but will have the opportunity to request a 96-gallon cart or a 30-gallon cart at no extra charge;
Bulk item: Up to two bulk items per collection day, which will include a table, a chair, a
mattress, etc.; Carpet: Up to eight rolls of carpet (and padding) per week; Home construction
material: Up to four 32-gallon rigid containers not exceeding 50 Ibs.

Recycling: Unlimited recycling collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra
charge. .

Yard waste: Unlimited yard waste collection service that runs April 1 through November 30, at
no extra charge;

Christmas Tree Pickup: Christmas Trees will be collected curbside through the end of January,
at no extra charge to the resident.

Village Facilities: Items included in Section 111, C., 3., of this document.

Base Rate + E-Waste

The Village of Maple Park would like the Contractor to submit a price for the Base Rate + E-
Waste.

For the purposes of this RFP, E-Waste includes the following:

Automotive Products: Antifreeze, batteries, brake fluid, motor oil and filters, fuels, etc.

Garden Chemicals: Fertilizers, insect sprays, herbicides, pesticides, and weed killers.

Paint Products: Paint, caulk, glue, stain, stripper, thinner and wood preservative.

Household cleaners: Ammonia, heavy-duty cleaner, upholstery cleaner, etc.

Electronics: Computers, monitors, keyboards, MP3 players, televisions, DVD/CD players, tape

players, VCRs, cell phones, desktop printers, fax machines, and microwaves.

e Mercury containing items: Batteries, compact fluorescent lamps fluorescent tubes, thermometers,
and thermostats.

e Sharps, needles and lancets: These items would need to be placed in a sealed, rigid, puncture-

resistant container.



Base Rate '

Effective Date Contractor Bill | Village Bill | Base Rate + E-Waste | Other Services Offered
February 1,2019 | No Bid $17.48 * i No Bid
February 1,2020 | no Bid $18.00 = No Bid
February 1,2021 | no Bid $18.54 * No Bid
February 1,2022° | No Bid | $19.10 2" i No Bid
February 1,2023 | no Bid | $19.67 x . No Bid
Discounted Rate for Senior Citizens: 10 % off Baste Rate
Do ybn own your own Material & Processing Recovery Facility? [ Yes [ No

In submitting the proposal, the CONTRACTOR agrees to all terms and conditions contained in
the “Request for Proposal for Residential Ref lection Service to the Village of Maple

Park, Illinois”. 2
S
-7 —/
Sig%ture of Company Official
Josh Molnar, Municipal Manager
Print Name & Title

*Groot will provide curbside collection for residents on a case-by-case
basis. This will prevent residents from having to pay for this service
that don’t use it. Residents that need collection of electronic items
shall call Groot direct and schedule a pick up at least 24 hours in
advance of their service day. Collection of up to 6 items ,excluding
televisions that weight more than 50lbs, will be available for a one-time
fee of $35.00. Items allowed under this program are as defined in our

operational approach.
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APPENDIX A

PROPOSAL SHEET FOR VILLAGE OF MAPLE PARK
RESIDENTIAL REFUSE COLLECTION SERVICE
PLEASE TYPE

Company Name: Advanced Disposal Services Solid Waste Midwest, LLC

DBA if applicable: Not applicable

Address: 1660 Hubbard Avenue, 1st Floor

City/State/Zip Code: Batavia, IL 60510

Phone: 630-587-8282

Fax: 630-761-0077

President / CEQ: John Spegal

Proposal Contact (if different): Tish Powell

Contact phone (if different): 630-762-7595

Contact Email: tish.powell@advanceddisposal.com

Proposed Pick up Day: Thursday

Base Rate shall include the following:

Refuse: Unlimited refuse collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra charge,
but will have the opportunity to request a 96-gallon cart or a 30-gallon cart at no extra charge;
Bulk item: Up to two bulk items per collection day, which will include a table, a chair, a
mattress, etc.; Carpet: Up to eight rolls of carpet (and padding) per week; Home construction
material: Up to four 32-gallon rigid containers not exceeding 50 Ibs.

Recyceling: Unlimited recycling collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra
charge.

Yard waste: Unlimited yard waste collection service that runs April 1 through November 30, at
no extra charge;

Christmas Tree Pickup: Christmas Trees will be collected curbside through the end of January,
at no extra charge to the resident.

Village Facilities: Items included in Section III, C., 3., of this document.

Base Rate + E-Waste

The Village of Maple Park would like the Contractor to submit a price for the Base Rate + E-
Waste.

For the purposes of this RFP, E-Waste includes the following:

Automotive Products: Antifreeze, batteries, brake fluid, motor oil and filters, fuels, etc.

Garden Chemicals: Fertilizers, insect sprays, herbicides, pesticides, and weed killers.

Paint Products: Paint, caulk, glue, stain, stripper, thinner and wood preservative,

Houschold cleaners: Ammonia, heavy-duty cleaner, upholstery cleaner, etc.

Electronics: Computers, monitors, keyboards, MP3 players, televisions, DVD/CD players, tape

players, VCRs, cell phones, desktop printers, fax machines, and microwaves.

e Mercury containing items: Batteries, compact fluorescent lamps fluorescent tubes, thermometers,
and thermostats.

e Sharps, needles and lancets: These items would need to be placed in a sealed, rigid, puncture-

resistant container.



Base Rate

Effective Date Comractor Bill | Villape Bill | Base Rate + E-Waste | Other Services Offerced
February 1,2019 |$22.00/unit/mo |$20.00/unit/mo See Below white goods: $30.00/each
February 1, 2020 |{$22.55/unit/mo [$20.50/unit/mo See Below white goods: $30.80/each
February 1, 2021 [$23.11/unit/mo [$21.01/unit/mo See Below white goods: $31.60/each
February 1,2022 |$23.69/unit/mo |$21.54/unit/mo See Below white goods: $32.40/each
February 1,2023 |$24.28/unit/mo | $22.08/unit/mo See Below white goods: $33.23/each

Discounted Rate for Senior Citizens: | © % off Baste Rate

Do vou own your own Material & Processing Recovery Facility? B Yes OO No

In submitting the proposal, the CONTRACTOR agrees to all terms and conditions contained in

the “*Request for Proposal for Residential Refuse Collection Service to

Park, lllinois”.

John Spegal, President

Village of Maple

any Official

Print Name & Title

*Curbside Electronics Recycling Rates

E-Waste Type

Televisions & Monitors

Cost Per Item

February 1, 2019
February 1, 2020
February 1, 2021
February 1, 2022
February 1, 2023

February 1, 2019
February 1, 2020
February 1, 2021
February 1, 2022
February 1, 2023

February 1, 2019
February 1, 2020
February 1, 2021
February 1, 2022
February 1, 2023

$35.00
$35.90
$36.82
$37.76
$38.72

Bundles of E-Waste (approx. 12" x 7" x 17")

$25.00
$25.64
$26.30
$26.97
$27.66

$15.00
$15.39
$15.79
$16.20
$16.62

Single Small E-Waste Items (approx. 12" x 7" x 4")



APPENDIX A

PROPOSAL SHEET FOR VILLAGE OF MAPLE PARK
RESIDENTIAL REFUSE COLLECTION SERVICE
PLEASE TYPE

Company Name: LRS DC Trash, LLC

DBA if applicable: Lakeshore Recycling Systems

Address; 8 S Hartness Place

City/State/Zip Code: Cortland, IL 60112

Phone: 773.685.8811

Fax:773.685.6043

President / CEQ: Alan T. Handley

Proposal Contact (if different): Katie Neary

Contact phone (if different): 815.901.2130

Contact Email: kneary @lIrsrecycles.com

Proposed Pick up Day: Tuesday

Base Rate shall include the following:

Refuse: Unlimited refuse collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra charge,
but will have the opportunity to request a 96-gallon cart or a 30-gallon cart at no extra charge;
Bulk item: Up to two bulk items per collection day, which will include a table, a chair, a
mattress, etc.; Carpet: Up to eight rolls of carpet (and padding) per week; Home construction
material: Up to four 32-gallon rigid containers not exceeding 50 Ibs.

Recycling: Unlimited recycling collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra
charge.

Yard waste: Unlimited yard waste collection service that runs April 1 through November 30, at
no extra charge;

Christmas Tree Pickup: Christmas Trees will be collected curbside through the end of J anuary,
at no extra charge to the resident.

Village Facilities: Items included in Section ITI, C., 3., of this document.

Base Rate + E-Waste

The Village of Maple Park would like the Contractor to submit a price for the Base Rate + E-
Waste.

For the purposes of this RFP, E-Waste includes the following:

® Automotive Products: Antifreeze, batteries, brake fluid, motor oil and filters, fuels, etc.

Garden Chemicals: Fertilizers, insect sprays, herbicides, pesticides, and weed killers.

Paint Products: Paint, caulk, glue, stain, stripper, thinner and wood preservative.

Household cleaners: Ammonia, heavy-duty cleaner, upholstery cleaner, etc.

Electronics: Computers, monitors, keyboards, MP3 players, televisions, DVD/CD players, tape

players, VCRs, cell phones, desktop printers, fax machines, and microwaves.

® Mercury containing items: Batteries, compact fluorescent lamps fluorescent tubes, thermometers,
and thermostats.




Base Rate Base Rate + E-Waste
Effective Date Contractor Bill | Village Bill | Contractor Bill | Village Bill | Other Services Offered
February 1, 2019 $22.80 $21.80 $24.05 $23.05 n/a
February 1, 2020 $23.71 $22.67 $25.01 $23.97 n/a
February 1, 2021 $24.66 $23.58 $26.01 $24.93 n/a
February 1, 2022 $25.65 $24.52 $27.05 $25.93 n/a
February 1, 2023 $26.68 $25.50 $28.13 $26.97 n/a
Discounted Rate for Senior Citizens: 2.5% % off Baste Rate

Do you own your own Material & Processing Recovery Facility? l Yes [0 No

In submitting the proposal, the CONTRACTOR agrees to all terms and conditions contained in
the “Request for Proposal for Residential Refuse Collection Service to the Village of Maple

ponsin

Park, Illinois™.

Signiture of Compan

fficial

d(mhe N@(U\J N\Ummm\ Nwwi@(

Print Name & Title \
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APPENDIX A

PROPOSAL SHEET FOR VILLAGE OF MAPLE PARK
RESIDENTIAL REFUSE COLLECTION SERVICE
PLEASE TYPE

Company Name: Waste Management of Illinois, Inc.

DBA if applicable:

Address: 720 E. Butterfield Road

City/State/Zit Code: Lombard, IL 60148

Phone: (847) 980-7648

Fax: (866) 897-9591

President/CEO: Michael J. Watson

Proposal Contact (ifdifferent): Vaughn Kuerschner

Contact phone (if different):

Contact Email: VKuerscl@wm.com,”

Proposed Pick up Day: sl2.basiz o
/

Base Rate shall include the following:

Refuse: Unlimited refuse collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra charge,
but will have the opportunity to request a 96-gallon cart or a 30-gallon cart at no extra charge;
Bulk item: Up to two bulk items per collection day, which will include a table, a chair, a
mattress, etc.; Carpet: Up to eight rolls of carpet (and padding) per week; Home construction
material: Up to four 32-gallon rigid containers not exceeding 50 Ibs.

Recveling: Unlimited recycling collection; Residents shall receive a 64-gallon cart at no extra
charge.

Yard waste: Unlimited yard waste collection service that runs April 1 through November 30, at
no extra charge;

Christmas Tree Pickup: Christmas Trees will be collected curbside through'the end ofJanuary,

at no extra charge to the resident.

Village Facilities: Items included in Section III, C., 3., of this document.

Base Rate + E-Waste

The Village of Maple Park would like the Contractor to submit a price for the Base Rate + E-
Waste.

For the purposes of this RFP, E-Waste includes the following:

= Automotive Products: Antifreeze, batteries, brake fluid, motor oil and filters, fuels, etc.

= Garden Chemicals: Fertilizers, insect sprays, herbicides, pesticides, and weed killers.

= Paint Products: Paint, caulk, glue, stain, stripper, thinner and wood preservative.

= Household cleaners: Anunonia, heavy-duty cleaner, upholstery cleaner, etc.

= Electronics: Computers, monitors, keyboards, MP3 players, televisions, DVD/CD players, tape
players, VCRs, cell phones, desktop printers, fax machines, and microwaves.

= Mercury containing items: Batteries, compact fluorescent lamps fluorescent tubes, thennometers,

and thermostats.
= Sharps, needles and lancets: These items would need to be placed in a sealed, rigid, puncture-

resistant container.



Base Rate Base Rate
(Village Bill)
+ E-Waste Other Services Offered

Contractor

Effective Date Bill Village Bill

Local Website

Recycle Often. Recycle Right.
Waste Watch

Disaster Debris Disposal

February 1, 2019 $17.42 $16.93 $18.23

Local Website

Recycle Often. Recycle Right.
Waste Watch

Disaster Debris Disposal

February 1, 2020 $18.05 $17.56 $18.86

Local Website

Recycle Often. Recycle Right.
Waste Watch

Disaster Debris Disposal

February 1, 2021 $18.71 $18.22 $19.52

Local Website

Recycle Often. Recycle Right.
Waste Watch

Disaster Debris Disposal

February 1, 2022 $19.39 $18.90 $20.20

Local Website

Recycle Often. Recycle Right.
Waste Watch

Disaster Debris Disposal

February 1, 2023 $20.10 $19.61 $20.91

e ® @ e [® © 9o O @ @ © © ® @ © O & @ ° ©

D¥s.counted Rate for Senior 10% off Baste Rate
Citizens:

Do you own your own Material & Processing Recovery Facility? EYes [0 No

In submitting the proposal, the CONTRACTOR agrees to all terms and conditions contained in
the “Request for Proposal for Residential Refuse Collectiop/Service to the ViHlage of Maple

Park, Illinois™. 7/ )
ot S i

S}gﬁ_‘ﬁure of Company Official

Vaughn Kuerschner, Public Sector Sales Rep
Print Name & Title



MAPLE PARK POLICE DEPARTMENT

To: Trustee Goucher

From: Chief Stiegemeier

Date: July 26, 2018

Subject: Village of Maple Park Ordinance Fees and Fines

Trustee Goucher — the ordinances that | would really like to have fees and
fines set for are on the Village of Maple Park -Notice of Ordinance Violation
tickets (attached). These are the most frequent violations and with the Board
setting a fee and fine schedule that will eliminate any “guess work” on the
officer’s part.

| have also attached the actual ordinance and fines schedule from the Village
of Kingston.

There are six copies of everything.

Respectfully,
Chief Stiegemeier



AS OF O/1S/1T

CHAPTER 54: Secondhand Goods
10-2 Permitted Hours of Sale 5100 §54-36 Secondhand Goods 5100 |74-12-207 Sport Lamps And Auxiliary Driving Lamps 575
10-3 Open Alcohol in Public $100 74-12-208 Signal Lamps And Signal Devices 875
10-5 Possession Om Alcohol ( Minor ) $100 CHAPTER 62: Streets, Sidewalks And Other Public Places 74-12-209 Additional Lighting E uipment 3875
5100 {62-6 Consumption OFf Alcohol on Public Streets, 74-12-210 Use Of Headlamps And Auxiliary
Sidewalks, And Right Of Ways $100 Driving Lamps $75
CHAPTER 18: Animals 62-103 _Unlawful Deposits $50 |74-12-211 Number Of Driving Lamps Required
13-4 Interfering With Officer $50162-104 _Obstruction Of Vison /000 FHLES & $50 Or Permitted $75
18-5 Restraint Required $50 JCHAPTER 74: Traffic And Vehicles 74-12-212 Special Restrictions On Lamps 575
18-6 Barking Dog $50 |74-71 Non-Roadway Vehicle On Roadway $60 |74-12-401 Restriction As To Tire Equipment 375
18-9 Cruelty To Animals $100 |74-72  Seat Belt Violation $60 |74-12-402 Sale Or Lease OF Siped Or
18-41 Dog Running At Large $50 [174-91 Limits And Restrictions 350 Re-Grooved Phneumatic Tire $75
18-41 Leash Required S50 (74-92 Engine Braking $60 {74-12-405 Operating Condition Of Phneumatic Tire $75
18-44 Failure To Remove Excrement $50 | 74-93 Squealing Of Tires $60 [74-12-501 Windshields And Safety Glazing
74-111  U-Turns Downtown)\ Posted 550 Material in Motor Vehicles $75
CHAPTER 26: Businesses 74-123  Unsafe Tires $60 [|74-12-502 Mirrors 575
26-79%9  Uninvited Soliciting $10074-146  Diagonal Parking On Certain Streets $50 §74-12-503 Windshield Must Be Un-obstructed
26-820 _ Soliciting Prohibited Hours $100 {74-147 c_s_nma E=E=m $40 And Equipped With Wipers §75
26-820  Soliciting Without A Permit $100 ('74-148 : y 74-12-600 Definitions 575
4148 i ’ Y $8P [74-12-601 Horns And Warning Devices $75
CHAPTER 50: Offenses And Miscellaneous Provisions 74-148 _ Handicapped Violation $250 174-12-602_Mufflers, Prevention Of Noise $75
50-31(b) Loitering $100 [74-148 _ Parked Blocking Driveway $50 §74-12-602.01 _ Excessive Braking Noise Signs $75
50-32 Excessive Exhaust Noise $60 Fra-a , 74-12-603 Seat Safety Belts $75
50-32 Excessive Noise (Music) $60 74-12-603.01 Driver And Passenger Required
50-32 Excessive Noise (Horns) S60 fma-14; : re o 0 To Use Safety Belts, Exceptions And Penaity $75
50-32 Production of Other Offensive Noise $60174-149  Parked On Unimproved Surface $40 174-12-604 Television Recievers $75
50-33 Hunting And Trapping $100 §74-150  Parked On Snow Route $60 §74-12-606 Tow Trucks Identification-
50-34 Disorderly Conduct $100§74-151 _ Vehicle Parked With Expired Registration $60 Equipment- Insurance $75
50-34(a) Noise Violation $100 Fra-241" - Obscured Wity ield: Or Windows $60'|74-12-607 Suspension System $75
50-34(b) Fighting $100§74-212  Faulty Tire Equipment $60 |74-12-607.01 _Frame And Floor Height 575
50-34(e) Public Intoxication $100§74-231  Vehicle Lighting $60 {74-12-608 Bumpers 375
50-34(h) Vandalism $100|74-343  Operation On Streets Or Alleys %? 2¢ 74-12-610 Headset Receivers 575
50-35-Pagséssioi OF Mearijuanna/Dryg: _vm.murmum%m % ::..3:.«.2_ Vehicles Cornres n. ta& Rel- | $40|74-12-611 _Sound Amplification Systems $75
mmrwm Passession OF | Drlip vnfah»? g B s - rable S60
EAEE _,mms__m s..:wn_ﬂmn <m_=n_m On Street | $40 {CHAPTER 82: Vegetation
Riding On Certain Sidewalks; Ramp &Gl $50 j8292 Weed MaightRestriction {8 akves or more)
Responsibility Of Parent Or Guardian $40
50-61 Possession Of Tobacco 74-12-101 Scope And Effect Of Equipment Regquirements 8758 $100
2ND Offense |74-12-201 When Lighted Lamps Are Required 875
3RD Offense 74-12-202 Clearance, Identification And $75
Curfew Violation Side Marker Lamps $75
U_mn:n_ﬁm oq rqmm::m\ Air Gun 74-12-203 Lamps On Parked Vehicles §75
i Ko R 74-12-204 _ Lamp Or Flag On Projecting Load $75
Prohibitions As To Weapons $75
And Dangerous Weapons $100 | 74-12-205.01 implements Of Husbandry Or Slow Moving 575
Vehicles- Display Of Amber Signal Lamp $75
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Village of Kingston
Ordinance 2017-04

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE VILLAGE OF KINGSTON MUNICIPAL CODE,
CHAPTER 1, SECTION 1-16

WHEREAS, the Village of Kingston has hereto adopted an ordinance relating to general penalties
(Chapter 1, Section 1-16) and said ordinance has thereafter been amended from time to time and is
currently in full force and effect in the Village of Kingston; and

WHEREAS, it is necessary from time to time to amend the Village of Kingston Municipal Code to
remain up-to-date with changing practices and community standards; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire and intention of the Board of Trustees of the Village of Kingston to
more adequately address the needs of the citizens of the Village of Kingston;

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained by the Board of Trustees of the Village of Kingston as foliows:
Section 1: That section 1-16 be amended by adding the following sections:

FINE SCHEDULE FOR PRE-PAYMENT OF ORDINANCE CITATIONS (ASSUMES ANY ORDINANCE NOT LISTED
HERE IS A MANDATORY COURT DATE UNTIL OTHERWISE AMENDED)

1-1: GENERAL PENALTY:

A. Petty Offense: Unless specifically provided elsewhere, any person found to have been in violation of
any of the terms and provisions of this Code which constitutes a petty offense shall be fined in an
amount not to exceed Seven hundred fifty doHars ($750.00).

B. Misdemeanor: A person found to have committed a violation of this Code which constitutes a
misdemeanor shall be sentenced, either alone or in combination as follows:

1. A period of incarceration not to exceed six {6) months;
2. Afine not to exceed Seven hundred and fifty doltars ($750.00).

C. A person to whom a notice is issued by a City Law Enforcement Officer for a violation of one of the
following offenses shall pay to the Village Clerk the amount specified for the violation with thirty (30)
days of receipt.

D. A person who fails to pay in accordance with Paragraph C above may be prosecuted in an
administrative adjudication hearing. Any person found to have committed a violation shall be subject to
the provisions of Sub-paragraph A or B of this Paragraph. If the offender fails to pay the City Clerk within
thirty (30) days, the Village will seek court adjudication and a fine up to $750.00.

E. A person found to have committed a violation of this code which requires a mandatory court
appearance shall be fined between the minimum fine of twenty-five ($25.00) and maximum fine of
seven hundred fifty dollars ($750.00).



F. Any minor (under eighteen years of age) who is issued a notice of a violation of the Kingston
Ordinance will be required to appear at an administrative adjudication hearing with a parent or
guardian.

Chapter 10: Alcoholic Beverages

10-2 Permitted Hours Of Sale $100
10-3 Open Alcohol in Public $100
10-5 Possession Of Alcohol (Minor) $100
10-13 Bassett Training $100

Chapter 18: Animals

18-4 Interfering With Officer $50
18-5 Restraint Required S50
18-6 Barking Dog $50
18-7 Keeping of Certain Animals Prohibited; exceptions

First Offense 5100

Second Offense $150

Third Offense $250
18-9 Cruelty To Animais $100
18-41 Dog Running At Large S50
18-41 Leash Required S50
18-44 Failure To Remove Excrement $50

Chapter 26: Businesses

26-799 Uninvited Soliciting 5100
26-820 Soliciting Prohibited Hours $100
26-820 Soliciting Without A Permit $100

Chapter 46: Manufactured Home and Trailers
46-32 Parking of Trailer - Occupied or Unoccupied S50

Chapter 50: Offenses And Miscellaneous Provisions

50-31(b) Loitering $100
50-32 Excessive Exhaust Noise S60
50-32 Excessive Noise (Music) S60
50-32 Excessive Noise (Horns) S60
50-32 Production Of Other Offensive Noise S60
50-33 Hunting And Trapping $100
50-34 Disorderly Conduct $100

50-34(a) Noise Violation $100



50-34(b)
50-34(e)
50-34(h)
50-35
50-35

50-36
50-37
50-38
50-61

50-81

50-116
50-117
50-118

Fighting
Public Intoxication
Vandalism
Possession Of Marijuana
Possession Of Drug Paraphernalia

Trespassing

Damage, Injury To Property

Littering '

Possession Of Tobacco

2ND Offense

3RD Offense

Curfew Violation

Discharge Of Firearms/Air Guns

Fireworks

Prohibitions As To Weapons And Dangerous Weapons

Chapter 54: Secondhand Goods

54-36

Secondhand Goods

Chapter 62: Streets, Sidewalks And Other Public Places

62-2
62-6

62-72
62-103
62-104

Obstructions

Consumption Of Alcohol On Public Streets, Sidewalks
And Right Of Ways.

Coasting

Unlawful Deposits

Obstruction of Vision

Chapter 74: Traffic And Vehicles

74-71
74-72
74-91
74-92
74-93
74-111
74-123
74-146
74-147
74-148
74-148
74-148

Non-Roadway Vehicle On Roadway
Seat Belt Violation

Limits And Restrictions

Engine Braking

Squealing Of Tires

U-Turns

Unsafe Tires

Diagonal Parking On Certain Streets
Limited Parking

Parked Blocking Sidewalk

Parked Facing Traffic

Handicapped Violation

$100
$100
$100
5200
$200

$100
$100
$50

$100
$200
$300
$100
$100
5100
$100

$100

$50
$100

$50
$50
$50

$60
$60
$50
$60
S60
$50
$60
$50
$40
$50
$50
$250



74-148
74-148
74-148
74-148
74-149
74-150
74-151
74-211
74-212
74-231
74-343
74-261
74-263
74-304
74-305
74-12-101
74-12-201
74-12-202
74-12-203
74-12-204
74-12-205

74-12-205.01

74-12-207
74-12-208
74-12-209
74-12-210
74-12-211
74-12-212
74-12-401
74-12-402
74-12-405
74-12-501
74-12-502
74-12-503

74-12-600
74-12-601
74-12-602

74-12-602.01

74-12-603

74-12-603.01

74-12-604

Parked Blocking Driveway

Parked Within 20 Feet Of Intersection Or Crosswalk
Parked Within 15 Feet Of A Fire Hydrant

Parking Where Official Signs Prohibit Parking
Parked On Unimproved Surface

Parked On Snow Route

Vehicle Parked With Expired Registration
Obscured Windshield Or Windows

Faulty Tire Equipment

Vehicle Lighting

Operation On Streets Or Alleys Unlicensed Vehicles
Abandoned/ inoperable

Leaving Wrecked Vehicle On Street

Riding On Certain Sidewalks; ramp

Responsibility Of Parent Or Guardian

Scope And Effect Of Equipment Requirements
When Lighted Lamps Are Required

Clearance, ldentification And side Marker Lamps
Lamps On Parked Vehicle

Lamp Or Flag On Projecting Load

Lamps On Other Vehicle And Equipment
Implements Of Husbandry Or Slow Moving
Vehicles - Display Of Amber Signal Lamp

Sport Lamps And Auxiliary Driving Lamps

Signal Lamps And Signal Devices

Additional Lighting Equipment

Use Of Headlamps And Auxiliary Driving Lamps
Number Of Driving Lamps Required Or Permitted
Special Restrictions On Lamps

Restriction As To Tire Equipment

Sale Or Lease Of Siped Or Re-grooved Phneumatic Tire

Operating Condition Of Phneumatic Tire

S50
S50
$50
S50
540
$60
S60
S60
$60
560
S40
S60
S40
S50
$50
$75
575
S75
$75
S75
S75
S75

$75
$75
$75
575
S75
$75
$75
S75
S75

Windshields And Safety Glazing Material In Motor Vehicles $75

Mirrors

Windshield Must Be Un-obstructed And Equipped
With Wipers

Definitions

Horns And Warning Devices

Mufflers, Prevention Of Noise

Excessive Braking Noise Signs

Seat Safety Belts

Driver And Passenger Required To Use Safety Belts,
Exceptions And Penalty

Television Receivers

S75
S75
S75
S75
S75
S75
S75
$75
$75

§75



74-12-606 Tow Trucks Identification - Equipment- Insurance S75

74-12-607 Suspension System $75
74-12-607.01 Frame And Floor Height 575
74-12-608 Bumpers §75
74-12-610  Headset Receivers $75
74-12-611  Sound Amplification Systems $75
Vegetation

82-92 Weed Height Restriction 5100
BOND FEES;

SECTION 1 In addition to any bail required in accordance with the laws of the State of
lllinois, or any other state, or the United States of America, any person arrested for violating a
bailable municipal ordinance or state or federal law, shall pay a fee of twenty ($20.00) for bail

processing.

SECTION 2 Any and all provisions of the Village of Kingston Municipal Code that are in
conflict herewith are repealed.

COURT FEES:

SECTION 1 Upon determination of liable in an Administrative Adjudication hearing a
fine shall be imposed as prescribed in Chapter 1, Section 1. In addition court costs shall be
assessed at a rate of fifty (§50.00) per violation.

SECTION 2 Any and all provisions of the Village of Kingston Municipal Code that are in
conflict herewith are repealed.

1-2: APPLICATION OF PROVISIONS:

A. The penalty provided in this Chapter shall be applicable to every section of this Municipal
Code the same as though it were a part of each and every separate action. Any person
convicted of a violation of any section of this Municipal Code where any duty is prescribed or
obligation imposed, or where any action which is of a continuing nature is forbidden or is
declared to be unlawful, shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor. A separate offense shall be
deemed committed upon each day such duty or obligation remains unperformed or such act
continues, unless otherwise specifically provided in this Municipal Code.

B. In all cases where the same offense is made punishable or is created by different clauses or
sections of this Municipal Code, the prosecuting officer may elect under which to proceed; but
not more than one recovery shall be had against the same person for the same offense;



provided, that the revocation of a license or permit shall not be considered a recovery or
penalty so as to bar any other penalty being enforced.

C. Whenever the doing of any act or the omission to do any act constitutes a breach of any
section or provision of this Municipal Code and there shall be no fine or penalty specifically
declared for such breach, the provisions of this Chapter shall apply.

1-3: RESPONSIBILTY FOR ACT:

A. Generally: Every person concerned in the commission of an act prohibited by this code,
whether he directly commits the act or prosecutes, counsels, aids or abets in its commission,
may be prosecuted and, on conviction, is punishable as if he had directly committed such act.

B. Liability of Officers: No provision of the Municipal code designating the duties of any officer
or employee shall be so construed as to make such officer or employee liable for any fine or
penalty provided for a failure to perform such duty, unless the intention of the Board of
Trustees to impose such fine or penalty on such officer or employee is specifically and clearly

expressed in the section creating duty.

SECTION 2: This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval
and publication as provided by law.

AYES:
NAYS:
ABSTAIN:
ABSENT:

PASSED by the Village Board of Trustees of the Village of Kingston, DeKalb County, fllinois, this
day of , 2017.

APPROVED by me this day of , 2017.

Jim Baenziger, Village President

(SEAL)

ATTESTED and filed in my office this day of i 2017

Angie Lauderdale, Village Clerk



CERTIFICATE

STATE OF ILLINOIS )
)ss.
COUNTY OF DEKALB )

I, Angie Lauderdale, certify that | am the duly appointed and acting municipal clerk of Kingston, DeKalb
County, Hlinois.

| further certify that on 2017, the Corporate Authorities of such municipality passed an
approved Ordinance 2017-04, entitled, An Ordinance amending the Village of Kingston Chapter 1, Section 1-16,
which provided by its terms that it should be published in pamphlet form.

The pampbhlet form of Ordinance2017-04, including the ordinance and cover sheet thereof prepared, and

a copy of such Ordinance was posted in the Village Hall, commencing on 2017, and continuing for
at least ten days thereafter. Copies of such Ordinance were also available for public inspection upon request in the

front office of the municipal clerk.

Dated at Kingston, Hllinais, this day of , 2017

Angie Lauderdale, Village Clerk



